

CHAVEZ & GERTLER LLP
Mark A. Chavez (CA Bar No. 90858)
Nance F. Becker (CA Bar No. 99292)
42 Miller Avenue
Mill Valley, California 94941
Tel: (415) 381-5599
Fax: (415) 381-5572
mark@chavezgertler.com
nance@chavezgertler.com

BRAUN LAW GROUP, P.C.
Michael D. Braun (CA Bar No. 167416)
1999 Avenue of the Stars, Ste. 1100
Los Angeles, California 90067
Tel: (310) 836-6000
Fax: (310) 836-6010
mdb@braunlawgroup.com

LAW OFFICES OF ANDREW KIERSTEAD
Andrew S. Kierstead (CA Bar No. 132105)
1001 SW 5th Avenue, Suite 1100
Portland, Oregon 97204
Tel: (508) 224-6246
Fax: (508) 244-4356
ajkier@aol.com

Attorneys for Plaintiffs Nicholas Miller, Jeffrey Borneman,
and the Proposed Class

**UNITED STATES DISTRICT COURT
CENTRAL DISTRICT OF CALIFORNIA**

<p>19 NICHOLAS MILLER and JEFFREY 20 BORNEMAN, individually and on 21 behalf of all others similarly situated, 22 23 Plaintiffs, 24 25 vs. 26 WISE COMPANY INC., 27 28 Defendant.</p>	<p>) Case No: 5:17-cv-00616-JAK-PLA) <u>CLASS ACTION</u>) SUPPLEMENTAL DECLARATION) OF NANCE F. BECKER IN) SUPPORT OF PLAINTIFFS’) UNOPPOSED MOTION FOR) PRELIMINARY APPROVAL)) Hrg. Date: May 7, 2018) Time: 8:30 a.m.) Ctrm: 10C) Hon. John A. Kronstadt</p>
---	---

1 I, Nance F. Becker, declare as follows:

2 1. I am an attorney admitted to practice before this Court, a partner in the
3 law firm Chavez & Gertler LLP, and one of the counsel of record for Plaintiffs
4 Nicholas Miller, Jeffrey Borneman, and the proposed Settlement Class in this
5 action. I have personal knowledge of all matters stated below, and if called upon to
6 do so I could testify competently to them.

7 2. On March 30, 2018, I filed a Declaration in Support of Plaintiffs’
8 Unopposed Motion for Preliminary Approval (“March Declaration”). This
9 Supplemental Declaration provides Supplemental Exhibit 8 correcting the
10 categorization of certain time and Supplemental Exhibits 9 and 10 setting forth
11 more detailed information about Class Counsel’s attorneys’ fees. Defendant’s
12 counsel has stated that Wise does not oppose the filing of this Supplemental
13 Declaration.

14 3. Exhibit 8 to my March Declaration included a detailed summary of
15 Plaintiffs’ Counsel’s time by task (Table 1), as well as by attorney (Table 2). The
16 total amount claimed included 662.5 hours (\$487,162.50) for work performed prior
17 to the filing of the Motion for Preliminary Approval, and an additional 155.7 hours
18 (\$104,000.00) representing our best estimate of the additional time likely to be
19 required in the future. Supplemental Exhibit 8 presents the same information,
20 except that after further review, we have assigned some of the time expended to a
21 different “task category” that more accurately reflects the nature of the work.

22 4. Attached hereto as Supplemental Exhibit 9 is an Excel spreadsheet
23 showing the detailed time entries supporting the summary of time devoted to this
24 case by Chavez & Gertler LLP, through March 30, 2018.

25 5. Attached hereto as Supplemental Exhibit 10 is an Excel spreadsheet
26 showing the detailed time entries supporting the summary of time devoted to this
27 case by the Braun Law Group, P.C. through March 30, 2018.

28

Supplemental
EXHIBIT 8

*Miller v. Wise***Table 1: Plaintiffs' Counsel Time By Task [SUPPLEMENTAL]****Task 1: Case Planning, Organization & Strategy**

Attorney	Law Firm	Hourly Rate	Year of Grad. & Qualifications	Hours	Fee
Mark A. Chavez	Chavez & Gertler LLP	\$ 850	1979 - Decl	43.5	\$ 36,975.00
Nance F. Becker	Chavez & Gertler LLP	\$ 750	1981 - Decl	36.7	\$ 27,525.00
Jonathan E. Gertler	Chavez & Gertler LLP	\$ 825	1983 - Decl	0.3	\$ 247.50
Dan L. Gildor	Chavez & Gertler LLP	\$ 695	2002 - Decl	1.8	\$ 1,251.00
Legal Asst/J. Raden	Chavez & Gertler LLP	\$ 225	Declaration	25	\$ 5,625.00
Michael Braun	Braun Law Group P.C.	\$ 700	1993 - Decl	19.85	\$ 13,895.00
Andrew S. Kierstead*	Law Offices of Andrew Kierstead		1987 - Decl		
Jason Riddick	Pltfs Personal Counsel	\$ 550	2004 - Decl	17	\$ 9,350.00
Jeffrey Huron	Pltfs Personal Counsel	\$ 650	1988 - Decl	2	\$ 1,300.00
Fee Request for Task 1				146.15	\$ 96,168.50

Task 2: Class Certification

Attorney	Law Firm	Hourly Rate	Year of Grad. & Qualifications	Hours	Fee
Nance F. Becker	Chavez & Gertler LLP	\$ 750	1981 - Decl	42.5	\$ 31,875.00
Andrew S. Kierstead*	Law Offices of Andrew Kierstead		1987 - Decl		
Fee Request for Task 2				42.5	\$ 31,875.00

Task 3: CMC appearance & preparation

Attorney	Law Firm	Hourly Rate	Year of Grad. & Qualifications	Hours	Fee
Nance F. Becker	Chavez & Gertler LLP	\$ 750	1981 - Decl	19.3	\$ 14,475.00
Andrew S. Kierstead*	Law Offices of Andrew Kierstead		1987 - Decl		
Fee Request for Task 3				19.3	\$ 14,475.00

Task 4: Depositions

Attorney	Law Firm	Hourly Rate	Year of Grad. & Qualifications	Hours	Fee
Mark A. Chavez	Chavez & Gertler LLP	\$ 850	1979 - Decl	23.8	\$ 20,230.00
Nance F. Becker	Chavez & Gertler LLP	\$ 750	1981 - Decl	21.5	\$ 16,125.00
Andrew S. Kierstead*	Law Offices of Andrew Kierstead		1987 - Decl		
Fee Request for Task 4				45.3	\$ 36,355.00

Task 5: Ex Parte, Attorneys Fees, etc

Attorney	Law Firm	Hourly Rate	Year of Grad. & Qualifications	Hours	Fee
Mark A. Chavez	Chavez & Gertler LLP	\$ 850	1979 - Decl	15	\$ 12,750.00
Nance F. Becker	Chavez & Gertler LLP	\$ 750	1981 - Decl	30.5	\$ 22,875.00
Legal Asst/J. Raden	Chavez & Gertler LLP	\$ 225	Declaration	10	\$ 2,250.00
Andrew S. Kierstead*	Law Offices of Andrew Kierstead		1987 - Decl		
Fee Request for Task 5				55.5	\$ 37,875.00

*Mr. Kierstead is suffering from a grave illness and has not been able to provide his time at this point

Task 6: Experts

Attorney	Law Firm	Hourly Rate	Year of Grad. & Qualifications	Hours	Fee
Mark A. Chavez	Chavez & Gertler LLP	\$ 850	1979 - Decl	5.4	\$ 4,590.00
Nance F. Becker	Chavez & Gertler LLP	\$ 750	1981 - Decl	31.4	\$ 23,550.00
Michael Braun	Braun Law Group P.C.	\$ 700	1993 - Decl	0.25	\$ 175.00
Andrew S. Kierstead*	Law Offices of Andrew Kierstead		1987 - Decl		

Fee Request for Task 6 37.05 \$ 28,315.00

Task 7: Legal and Other Research

Attorney	Law Firm	Hourly Rate	Year of Grad. & Qualifications	Hours	Fee
Mark A. Chavez	Chavez & Gertler LLP	\$ 850	1979 - Decl	7.9	\$ 6,715.00
Jonathan E. Gertler	Chavez & Gertler LLP	\$ 825	1983 - Decl	1.9	\$ 1,567.50
Nance F. Becker	Chavez & Gertler LLP	\$ 750	1981 - Decl	4.7	\$ 3,525.00
Dan L. Gildor	Chavez & Gertler LLP	\$ 695	2002 - Decl	1.9	\$ 1,320.50
Michael Braun	Braun Law Group P.C.	\$ 700	1993 - Decl	30.5	\$ 21,350.00
Andrew S. Kierstead*	Law Offices of Andrew Kierstead		1987 - Decl		
Jason Riddick	Pltfs Personal Counsel	\$ 550	2004 - Decl	11	\$ 6,050.00
Jeffrey Huron	Pltfs Personal Counsel	\$ 650	1988 - Decl	2	\$ 1,300.00

Fee Request for Task 7 59.9 \$ 41,828.00

Task 8: Discovery

Attorney	Law Firm	Hourly Rate	Year of Grad. & Qualifications	Hours	Fee
Mark A. Chavez	Chavez & Gertler LLP	\$ 850	1979 - Decl	4.8	\$ 4,080.00
Nance F. Becker	Chavez & Gertler LLP	\$ 750	1981 - Decl	40.2	\$ 30,150.00
Legal Asst/J. Raden	Chavez & Gertler LLP	\$ 225	Declaration	13	\$ 2,925.00
Legal Asst/N. Martin	Chavez & Gertler LLP	\$ 225	Declaration	7	\$ 1,575.00
Michael Braun	Braun Law Group P.C.	\$ 700	1993 - Decl	12.1	\$ 8,470.00
Andrew S. Kierstead*	Law Offices of Andrew Kierstead		1987 - Decl		

Fee Request for Task 8 77.1 \$ 47,200.00

Task 9: Pleadings & Motions

Attorney	Law Firm	Hourly Rate	Year of Grad. & Qualifications	Hours	Fee
Mark A. Chavez	Chavez & Gertler LLP	\$ 850	1979 - Decl	18.3	\$ 15,555.00
Nance F. Becker	Chavez & Gertler LLP	\$ 750	1981 - Decl	12.8	\$ 9,600.00
Dan L. Gildor	Chavez & Gertler LLP	\$ 695	2002 - Decl	10.8	\$ 7,506.00
Michael Braun	Braun Law Group P.C.	\$ 700	1993 - Decl	71.75	\$ 50,225.00
Andrew S. Kierstead*	Law Offices of Andrew Kierstead		1987 - Decl		
Jason Riddick	Pltfs Personal Counsel	\$ 550	2004 - Decl	5	\$ 2,750.00

Fee Request for Task 9 118.65 \$ 85,636.00

Task 10: Settlement & Approval Motions

Attorney	Law Firm	Hourly Rate	Year of Grad. & Qualifications	Hours	Fee
Mark A. Chavez	Chavez & Gertler LLP	\$ 850	1979 - Decl	93.6	\$ 79,560.00
Nance F. Becker	Chavez & Gertler LLP	\$ 750	1981 - Decl	113.4	\$ 85,050.00
Michael Braun	Braun Law Group P.C.	\$ 700	1993 - Decl	9.75	\$ 6,825.00
Andrew S. Kierstead*	Law Offices of Andrew Kierstead		1987 - Decl		

Fee Request for Task 10 216.75 \$ 171,435.00

Summary of Attorney Time		
Task	Hours	Fees
Task 1: Case Planning, Organization & Strategy	146.15	\$ 96,168.50
Task 2: Class Certification	42.5	\$ 31,875.00
Task 3: CMC appearance & preparation	19.3	\$ 14,475.00
Task 4: Depositions	45.3	\$ 36,355.00
Task 5: Ex Parte, Attorneys Fees, etc	55.5	\$ 37,875.00
Task 6: Experts	37.05	\$ 28,315.00
Task 7: Legal and Other Research	59.9	\$ 41,828.00
Task 8: Discovery	77.1	\$ 47,200.00
Task 9: Pleadings & Motions	118.65	\$ 85,636.00
Task 10: Settlement & Approval Motions	216.75	\$ 171,435.00
TOTAL:	818.2	\$ 591,162.50

Class Representative Time

Task	Nicholas Miller	Jeffrey Borneman	Total
Investigation: Review FDA nutrition requirements and investigate competing products	3	3	6
Consultation with counsel	4	6	10
Pleadings: review complaint and other documents	2	4	6
Initial disclosures	1	1	2
Conferences: emails and calls with attorneys re case progress	3	3	6
Class Cert: discuss class cert motion and prepare declaration	3	3	6
Mediation: confer re mediation and settlement	2	3	5
Settlement: review and approve agreement	1	1	2
Preliminary Approval: confer re motion	1	1	2
Final Approval: review documents and draft declaration	2	2	4
TOTALS:	22	27	49

*Miller v. Wise***Table 2: Plaintiffs' Counsel Time By Attorney [SUPPLEMENTAL]**

Attorney	Rate	Hours by Task		TOTALS
Mark A. Chavez Chavez & Gertler LLP	\$850	Task 1: Case Organization	43.5	Hours:
		Task 2: Class Certification	0	212.3
		Task 3: CMC	0	
		Task 4: Depositions	23.8	
		Task 5: Ex Parte, Attorneys Fees	15	
		Task 6: Experts	5.4	Amount:
		Task 7: Research	7.9	\$ 180,455.00
		Task 8: Discovery	4.8	
		Task 9: Pleadings & Motions	18.3	
		Task 10: Settlement	93.6	
Jonathan E. Gertler Chavez & Gertler LLP	\$825	Task 1: Case Organization	0.3	Hours:
		Task 2: Class Certification	0	2.2
		Task 3: CMC	0	
		Task 4: Depositions	0	
		Task 5: Ex Parte, Attorneys Fees	0	
		Task 6: Experts	0	\$ 1,815.00
		Task 7: Research	1.9	
		Task 8: Discovery	0	
		Task 9: Pleadings & Motions	0	
		Task 10: Settlement	0	
Nance F. Becker Chavez & Gertler LLP	\$750	Task 1: Case Organization	36.7	Hours:
		Task 2: Class Certification	42.5	353
		Task 3: CMC	19.3	
		Task 4: Depositions	21.5	
		Task 5: Ex Parte, Attorneys Fees	30.5	
		Task 6: Experts	31.4	\$ 264,750.00
		Task 7: Research	4.7	
		Task 8: Discovery	40.2	
		Task 9: Pleadings & Motions	12.8	
		Task 10: Settlement	113.4	
Dan L. Gildor Chavez & Gertler LLP	\$695	Task 1: Case Organization	1.8	Hours:
		Task 2: Class Certification	0	14.5
		Task 3: CMC	0	
		Task 4: Depositions	0	
		Task 5: Ex Parte, Attorneys Fees	0	
		Task 6: Experts	0	\$ 10,077.50
		Task 7: Research	1.9	
		Task 8: Discovery	0	
		Task 9: Pleadings & Motions	10.8	
		Task 10: Settlement	0	

Legal Asst Chavez & Gertler LLP	\$225	Task 1: Case Organization	25	Hours:
		Task 2: Class Certification	0	55
		Task 3: CMC	0	
		Task 4: Depositions	0	
		Task 5: Ex Parte, Attorneys Fees	10	
		Task 6: Experts	0	Amount:
		Task 7: Research	0	\$ 12,375.00
		Task 8: Discovery	20	
		Task 9: Pleadings & Motions	0	
		Task 10: Settlement	0	
Michael Braun Braun Law Group P.C.	\$700	Task 1: Case Organization	19.85	Hours:
		Task 2: Class Certification	0	144.2
		Task 3: CMC	0	
		Task 4: Depositions	0	
		Task 5: Ex Parte, Attorneys Fees	0	
		Task 6: Experts	0.25	\$ 100,940.00
		Task 7: Research	30.5	
		Task 8: Discovery	12.1	
		Task 9: Pleadings & Motions	71.75	
		Task 10: Settlement	9.75	
Jason Riddick	\$550	Task 1: Case Organization	17	Hours:
		Task 2: Class Certification	0	33
		Task 3: CMC	0	
		Task 4: Depositions	0	
		Task 5: Ex Parte, Attorneys Fees	0	
		Task 6: Experts	0	\$ 18,150.00
		Task 7: Research	11	
		Task 8: Discovery	0	
		Task 9: Pleadings & Motions	5	
		Task 10: Settlement	0	
Jeffrey Huron	\$650	Task 1: Case Organization	2	Hours:
		Task 2: Class Certification	0	4
		Task 3: CMC	0	
		Task 4: Depositions	0	
		Task 5: Ex Parte, Attorneys Fees	0	
		Task 6: Experts	0	\$ 2,600.00
		Task 7: Research	2	
		Task 8: Discovery	0	
		Task 9: Pleadings & Motions	0	
		Task 10: Settlement	0	

Andrew Kierstead* Law Offices of Andrew Kierstead	Task 1: Case Organization		Hours: 0
	Task 2: Class Certification		
	Task 3: CMC		
	Task 4: Depositions		
	Task 5: Ex Parte, Attorneys Fees		
	Task 6: Experts		Amount: \$ -
	Task 7: Research		
	Task 8: Discovery		
	Task 9: Pleadings & Motions		
	Task 10: Settlement		

**Mr. Kierstead is suffering from a grave illness and has not been able to provide his time at this point*

Summary of Attorney Time				
Attorney	Rate	Tasks	Hours	Fees
Mark A. Chavez	\$850	All Tasks	212.3	\$ 180,455.00
Jonathan E. Gertler	\$825	All Tasks	2.2	\$ 1,815.00
Nance F. Becker	\$750	All Tasks	353	\$ 264,750.00
Dan L. Gildor	\$695	All Tasks	14.5	\$ 10,077.50
Legal Asst	\$225	All Tasks	55	\$ 12,375.00
Michael Braun	\$700	All Tasks	144.2	\$ 100,940.00
Andrew Kierstead*		All Tasks	*	
Jason Riddick	\$550	All Tasks	33	\$ 18,150.00
Jeffrey Huron	\$650	All Tasks	4	\$ 2,600.00
Total:			818.2	\$ 591,162.50

Class Representative Time			
Task	Nicholas Miller	Jeffrey Borneman	Total
Investigation: Review FDA nutrition requirements and investigate competing products	3	3	6
Consultation with counsel	4	6	10
Pleadings: review complaint and other documents	2	4	6
Initial disclosures	1	1	2
Conferences: emails and calls with attorneys re case progress	3	3	6
Class Cert: discuss class cert motion and prepare declaration	3	3	6
Mediation: confer re mediation and settlement	2	3	5
Settlement: review and approve agreement	1	1	2
Preliminary Approval: confer re motion	1	1	2
Final Approval: review documents and draft declaration	2	2	4
TOTALS:	22	27	49

Supplemental
EXHIBIT 9

Chavez & Gertler LLP
Miller v. Wise Company, Inc.
[Supplemental Exhibit 9 - Detailed Time Entries]

Date	ID	Attorney	Time	Rate	Slip Value	Activity	Description
6/10/2016	192841	Dan Gildor	1.10	\$695.00	\$764.50	12-Research	Review complaint re: Wise Foods; legal research re: same. Prepare email memo re: same.
6/11/2016	192852	Dan Gildor	0.30	\$695.00	\$208.50	12-Research	Review Wise Company website and representations; respond to email from M. Chavez.
6/13/2016	193541	Jonathan E. Gertler	0.30	\$825.00	\$247.50	10-Case Org	Kierstead referral regarding survival food manufacturer Wise Co.
6/15/2016	192930	Dan Gildor	0.10	\$695.00	\$69.50	12-Research	Read emails re: Wise Company mislabeling possible.
6/15/2016	192989	Mark A. Chavez	3.40	\$850.00	\$2,890.00	12-Research	Review draft of complaint; research; teleconferences regarding Wise food case.
6/17/2016	194351	Jonathan E. Gertler	1.10	\$825.00	\$907.50	12-Research	Miller v. Wise Company - review draft complaint and quick research.
6/19/2016	194352	Jonathan E. Gertler	0.80	\$825.00	\$660.00	12-Research	Miller v. Wise Company - consultation with Lowenthal.
6/21/2016	193489	Mark A. Chavez	2.10	\$850.00	\$1,785.00	12-Research	Research regarding Wise case and emails.
6/23/2016	193510	Mark A. Chavez	2.40	\$850.00	\$2,040.00	12-Research	Review and prepare emails regarding Wise case; teleconference with co-counsel regarding case; research.
8/12/2016	194441	Dan Gildor	0.40	\$695.00	\$278.00	12-Research	Review emails re: Wise Foods possible re: nutrition.
8/12/2016	195132	Mark A. Chavez	1.10	\$850.00	\$935.00	10-Case Org	Review draft of complaint; review and prepare e-mails; review file.
8/15/2016	194537	Dan Gildor	5.40	\$695.00	\$3,753.00	01-Pleadings	Review and revise draft complaint. Review file. Legal research re: same. Exchange emails with co-counsel re: venue and jurisdiction issues, cert issues, and screenshots of webpages.
8/16/2016	194538	Dan Gildor	2.10	\$695.00	\$1,459.50	01-Pleadings	Continue drafting/revising complaint. Draft venue declaration and respond to emails re: venue.
8/17/2016	194867	Dan Gildor	0.20	\$695.00	\$139.00	10-Case Org	Exchange emails re: case file.
8/17/2016	195144	Mark A. Chavez	3.10	\$850.00	\$2,635.00	10-Case Org	Review of background documents and e-mails; review draft of complaint; prepare and review e-mails regarding complaint.
8/17/2016	194866	Dan Gildor	0.60	\$695.00	\$417.00	01-Pleadings	Review revisions to draft complaint and revise same; exchange emails re: revised complaint.
8/18/2016	195073	Dan Gildor	2.30	\$695.00	\$1,598.50	01-Pleadings	Review and revise draft complaint; exchange emails w/ M. Chavez re: same; phone call w/ M. Chavez re: same.
8/18/2016	195696	Mark A. Chavez	2.80	\$850.00	\$2,380.00	10-Case Org	Review and edit complaint; telephone call with D. Gildor regarding complaint; review and prepare e-mails regarding complaint.

Date	ID	Attorney	Time	Rate	Slip Value	Activity	Description
8/19/2016	195105	Dan Gildor	0.40	\$695.00	\$278.00	01-Pleadings	Exchange emails w/ M. Chavez re: draft complaint; phone call w/ M. Chavez re: same.
8/23/2016	195322	Dan Gildor	1.30	\$695.00	\$903.50	10-Case Org	Prepare co-counsel and retainer agreements. Phone call w/ M. Chavez re: same. Exchange emails re: same.
8/29/2016	195545	Dan Gildor	0.10	\$695.00	\$69.50	10-Case Org	Read email re: co-counsel and retainer agreements.
9/19/2016	196226	Dan Gildor	0.10	\$695.00	\$69.50	10-Case Org	Read emails re: co-counsel agreement.
9/23/2016	196493	Dan Gildor	0.10	\$695.00	\$69.50	10-Case Org	Exchange emails w/ M. Chavez re: status.
11/16/2016	198297	Mark A. Chavez	0.60	\$850.00	\$510.00	10-Case Org	Review and prepare emails
1/6/2017	199684	Nance Becker	3.00	\$750.00	\$2,250.00	01-Pleadings	Review background documents. Set up client files. Email co-counsel regarding argument. Revise complaint. Research regarding agent for service.
1/9/2017	199675	Nance Becker	0.60	\$750.00	\$450.00	01-Pleadings	Email with co-counsel; confer with M. Chavez regarding complaint; circulate revised complaint.
1/10/2017	199672	Nance Becker	0.10	\$750.00	\$75.00	01-Pleadings	Email with co-counsel regarding complaint and venue.
1/10/2017	199674	Nance Becker	0.40	\$750.00	\$300.00	01-Pleadings	Review email and redlined complaint from co-counsel in preparation for meeting to finalize allegations review defendant website.
1/17/2017	199799	Nance Becker	0.50	\$750.00	\$375.00	01-Pleadings	Telephone call with co-counsel regarding refining allegations of complaint.
1/24/2017	199811	Nance Becker	1.50	\$750.00	\$1,125.00	01-Pleadings	Begin revising complaint per discussion with co-counsel; review defendant's website in connection with same.
1/26/2017	199824	Nance Becker	1.00	\$750.00	\$750.00	01-Pleadings	Finish revising complaint.
1/30/2017	199853	Nance Becker	0.30	\$750.00	\$225.00	01-Pleadings	Review and respond to co-counsel's suggested edits to complaint.
2/3/2017	202179	Nance Becker	0.20	\$750.00	\$150.00	01-Pleadings	Review co-counsel's edits to complaint, confer with M. Chavez regarding complaint.
2/6/2017	202345	Nance Becker	0.20	\$750.00	\$150.00	01-Pleadings	Corrections with co-counsel regarding factual allegations. Review documents he forwarded.
2/9/2017	202355	Nance Becker	2.00	\$750.00	\$1,500.00	01-Pleadings	Telephone interviews of both class representatives & preparation for the same. Forward complaint to them for review.
2/14/2017	202530	Nance Becker	1.00	\$750.00	\$750.00	02-Discovery	Draft document requests
2/14/2017	202531	Nance Becker	0.70	\$750.00	\$525.00	08-CMC	Draft initial case management conference statement.
2/14/2017	202529	Nance Becker	1.00	\$750.00	\$750.00	01-Pleadings	Proofread file complaint and related documents, research applicable local rules
2/15/2017	202532	Nance Becker	0.10	\$750.00	\$75.00	01-Pleadings	Confer with staff regarding filing issues

Date	ID	Attorney	Time	Rate	Slip Value	Activity	Description
2/16/2017	202615	Nance Becker	0.30	\$750.00	\$225.00	01-Pleadings	Review documents returned from court after filing, research regarding assigned judge
3/9/2017	200833	Nance Becker	0.20	\$750.00	\$150.00	08-CMC	Review case management order.
3/29/2017	200920	Nance Becker	0.10	\$750.00	\$75.00	10-Case Org	Review upcoming deadlines.
3/31/2017	201346	Nance Becker	0.20	\$750.00	\$150.00	01-Pleadings	Review notice of removal & related documents, email co-counsel.
4/3/2017	201327	Nance Becker	3.00	\$750.00	\$2,250.00	10-Case Org	Review all documents served by defendant, review local rules and standing orders. Prepare notice of interested parties. Revise first RPD's. Email clients regarding removal.
4/4/2017	201329	Nance Becker	0.20	\$750.00	\$150.00	01-Pleadings	Review defendant's answer
4/4/2017	201330	Nance Becker	3.00	\$750.00	\$2,250.00	02-Discovery	Revise RPD's & draft special interrogatories.
4/4/2017	201358	Mark A. Chavez	0.70	\$850.00	\$595.00	02-Discovery	Review Defendant's answer, confer with Nance regarding discovery and statutes.
4/4/2017	201328	Nance Becker	2.00	\$750.00	\$1,500.00	10-Case Org	Telephone call with co-counsel regarding defendant's pleading, discovery, scheduling and strategy. telephone call with opposing regarding discovery and scheduling. Draft proposed stipulation and order.
4/6/2017	201320	Nance Becker	1.60	\$750.00	\$1,200.00	02-Discovery	Review scheduling order and revise stipulation and proposed order. Confer with co-counsel regarding discovery, revise RFPs.
4/17/2017	201778	Nance Becker	0.60	\$750.00	\$450.00	02-Discovery	Begin drafting RFAS
4/18/2017	201779	Nance Becker	2.00	\$750.00	\$1,500.00	04-Experts	Review correspondence received from nutrition consultant. Telephone call with nutrition consultant, memorandum regarding same. Research regarding other potential experts.
4/18/2017	201780	Nance Becker	1.50	\$750.00	\$1,125.00	02-Discovery	Finish drafting RFAs, confer with co counsel regarding same.
4/18/2017	201781	Nance Becker	0.40	\$750.00	\$300.00	08-CMC	Draft R. 26 report
4/19/2017	201762	Mark A. Chavez	0.90	\$850.00	\$765.00	10-Case Org	Review draft requests for admission, review and preparation of emails regarding expert
4/20/2017	201795	Nance Becker	2.50	\$750.00	\$1,875.00	05-Class cert	research regarding class certification
4/20/2017	201792	Nance Becker	0.70	\$750.00	\$525.00	02-Discovery	Draft additional discovery, emails to co-counsel
4/20/2017	201793	Nance Becker	0.70	\$750.00	\$525.00	02-Discovery	Draft additional discovery, emails to co-counsel
4/20/2017	201794	Nance Becker	1.00	\$750.00	\$750.00	10-Case Org	Continue drafting Rule 26 statement
4/21/2017	201801	Nance Becker	1.20	\$750.00	\$900.00	08-CMC	Further work on Rule 26 report, Conference with co-counsel and email opposition. Counsel regarding same
4/21/2017	201800	Nance Becker	0.20	\$750.00	\$150.00	02-Discovery	Review and edit subpoenas to third parties

Date	ID	Attorney	Time	Rate	Slip Value	Activity	Description
4/27/2017	201830	Nance Becker	2.00	\$750.00	\$1,500.00	08-CMC	telephone call to meet and confer with defendant's counsel regarding rule 26 expert and scheduling conference, preparation for same, follow-up call with co-counsel.
4/28/2017	201845	Nance Becker	0.30	\$750.00	\$225.00	02-Discovery	Review and respond to emails from opposing counsel & co-counsel regarding discovery
4/28/2017	201846	Nance Becker	0.20	\$750.00	\$150.00	10-Case Org	Draft preservation letter to defendant
5/1/2017	201855	Nance Becker	1.50	\$750.00	\$1,125.00	08-CMC	Review corrections from defendant regarding scheduling issues, confer with M. Braun regarding same. Revise draft Rule 26 report & draft proposed schedule.
5/2/2017	201859	Nance Becker	0.60	\$750.00	\$450.00	08-CMC	Arrange travel for scheduling conference. Confer with M. Braun regarding Rule 26 report and incorporate his edits.
5/4/2017	201889	Nance Becker	0.20	\$750.00	\$150.00	12-Research	Review Costco settlement in similar action
5/11/2017	201922	Nance Becker	0.50	\$750.00	\$375.00	02-Discovery	emails, clients, counsel for Home depot and co-counsel
5/16/2017	201988	Nance Becker	0.10	\$750.00	\$75.00	08-CMC	Forward documents regarding initial disclosures to opposing counsel
5/22/2017	202548	Nance Becker	0.40	\$750.00	\$300.00	12-Research	Confer with M. Braun regarding 3rd party discovery, research regarding plaintiff's claims
5/22/2017	202546	Nance Becker	0.30	\$750.00	\$225.00	02-Discovery	Review Home Depot response to subpoena
5/22/2017	202545	Nance Becker	0.20	\$750.00	\$150.00	02-Discovery	Review and edit draft Rule 26 disclosures
5/23/2017	202568	Nance Becker	0.20	\$750.00	\$150.00	10-Case Org	Email opposing counsel, regarding trial schedule
5/23/2017	202569	Nance Becker	0.70	\$750.00	\$525.00	10-Case Org	Review defendant's sections of Rule 26 report and incorporate into trial report. Draft response to defendant's position regarding case schedule and file report.
5/23/2017	202564	Nance Becker	0.30	\$750.00	\$225.00	10-Case Org	Review defendant's initial disclosures, serve plaintiff's disclosures.
5/23/2017	202565	Nance Becker	0.30	\$750.00	\$225.00	12-Research	Research regarding scope of class
5/26/2017	202584	Nance Becker	2.00	\$750.00	\$1,500.00	10-Case Org	Review defendant's responses to written discovery and outline points for reply. Review email from co-counsel regarding 3rd party subpoenas
6/1/2017	202590	Nance Becker	0.10	\$750.00	\$75.00	08-CMC	Emails, M. Braun regarding scheduling conference
6/2/2017	202539	Nance Becker	1.00	\$750.00	\$750.00	08-CMC	Prepare for Monday's hearing and confer with co-counsel regarding discovery schedule.
6/5/2017	202533	Nance Becker	7.50	\$750.00	\$5,625.00	08-CMC	Travel to LA and appear at initial scheduling conference
6/6/2017	202536	Nance Becker	4.00	\$750.00	\$3,000.00	08-CMC	Return travel from LA
6/12/2017	202710	Nance Becker	0.80	\$750.00	\$600.00	02-Discovery	Begin drafting meet and confer letter regarding defendant's written discovery responses
6/15/2017	202704	Nance Becker	1.20	\$750.00	\$900.00	02-Discovery	Finish draft meet and confer letter

Date	ID	Attorney	Time	Rate	Slip Value	Activity	Description
6/16/2017	202686	Nance Becker	0.80	\$750.00	\$600.00	03-Deposition	Outline topics for 30(b)(6) depositions and call Utah counsel.
6/16/2017	202685	Nance Becker	0.20	\$750.00	\$150.00	02-Discovery	Review co-counsel's edits and finalize meet and confer letter.
6/19/2017	202690	Nance Becker	4.50	\$750.00	\$3,375.00	10-Case Org	research regarding Wise website and case regarding class certification.
6/19/2017	202689	Nance Becker	0.80	\$750.00	\$600.00	10-Case Org	telephone call with M. Braun regarding pending and future discovery and strategy.
6/20/2017	202696	Nance Becker	2.50	\$750.00	\$1,875.00	05-Class cert	Begin drafting class certification memorandum.
6/20/2017	202695	Nance Becker	1.00	\$750.00	\$750.00	04-Experts	Telephone call and follow up communications with potential expert regarding consumer behavior.
6/20/2017	202694	Nance Becker	1.00	\$750.00	\$750.00	10-Case Org	Prepare pretrial task list
6/22/2017	202713	Nance Becker	0.60	\$750.00	\$450.00	04-Experts	Telephone call with potential expert and memorandum regarding same, confer with M. Braun
6/27/2017	203000	Nance Becker	0.20	\$750.00	\$150.00	02-Discovery	Email regarding discovery to opposing counsel
6/30/2017	202907	Nance Becker	0.30	\$750.00	\$225.00	04-Experts	Prepare expert retainer agreement
7/10/2017	203664	Nance Becker	0.20	\$750.00	\$150.00	10-Case Org	Confer with M. Chavez and draft corrections to opposing counsel regarding potential mediators
7/13/2017	203661	Nance Becker	0.80	\$750.00	\$600.00	04-Experts	Research regarding nutrition experts, email potential expert
7/18/2017	203298	Michael Levy	0.70	\$465.00	\$325.50	12-Research	Download web pages from Wayback Machine.
7/18/2017	203217	Nance Becker	0.50	\$750.00	\$375.00	04-Experts	telephone call and email with potential dictation expert
7/18/2017	203216	Nance Becker	1.00	\$750.00	\$750.00	02-Discovery	Letter from opposing counsel regarding discovery issues, meet with M. Chavez regarding case planning.
7/20/2017	203208	Nance Becker	1.20	\$750.00	\$900.00	01-Pleadings	outline response to defendant's meet and confer letter, emails with co-counsel regarding same
7/20/2017	203207	Nance Becker	0.80	\$750.00	\$600.00	10-Case Org	review documents and confer with staff regarding obtaining archived copies of defendant's website.
7/20/2017	203209	Nance Becker	0.10	\$750.00	\$75.00	10-Case Org	Confer w J. Gertler regarding expert
7/21/2017	203212	Nance Becker	1.50	\$750.00	\$1,125.00	02-Discovery	Work on meet and confer letter
7/21/2017	203211	Nance Becker	0.20	\$750.00	\$150.00	02-Discovery	review defendant responses to plaintiff second request for production
7/24/2017	203221	Nance Becker	0.50	\$750.00	\$375.00	02-Discovery	Revise and send second meet & confer letter regarding defendant's failure to produce documents
7/24/2017	203222	Nance Becker	3.50	\$750.00	\$2,625.00	03-Deposition	Draft 30(b)(6) deposition notice and document request, confer with M. Chavez regarding depositions, research Utah reporters and confer with staff regarding same
7/24/2017	203377	Mark A. Chavez	1.00	\$850.00	\$850.00	01-Pleadings	Conference with Nance regarding status and depositions, review and edit meet and confer letter, review complaint

Date	ID	Attorney	Time	Rate	Slip Value	Activity	Description
7/25/2017	203225	Nance Becker	0.10	\$750.00	\$75.00	04-Experts	Correspondence with expert
7/25/2017	203226	Nance Becker	1.00	\$750.00	\$750.00	02-Discovery	Begin drafting motion to compel
7/25/2017	203224	Nance Becker	3.30	\$750.00	\$2,475.00	03-Deposition	Meet with M. Chavez regarding finalized deposition notice, confer with court reporters
7/26/2017	203380	Mark A. Chavez	2.40	\$850.00	\$2,040.00	01-Pleadings	review file, review complaint, review and edit discovery requests, confer with Nance regarding status and motion to compel
7/27/2017	203251	Nance Becker	0.40	\$750.00	\$300.00	04-Experts	Telephone calls, emails with expert witness consultants
7/27/2017	203247	Nance Becker	0.30	\$750.00	\$225.00	02-Discovery	Meet with M. Chavez and email co-counsel regarding discovery issues
7/27/2017	203248	Nance Becker	2.50	\$750.00	\$1,875.00	02-Discovery	Conduct detailed review of web pages and draft proposed stipulation of facts
7/27/2017	203250	Nance Becker	0.30	\$750.00	\$225.00	02-Discovery	Review defendant's meet and confer letter and begin drafting response
7/27/2017	203383	Mark A. Chavez	0.60	\$850.00	\$510.00	10-Case Org	review meet and confer letter and review file
7/28/2017	203237	Nance Becker	3.00	\$750.00	\$2,250.00	02-Discovery	Revise meet and confer letter and proposed stipulation. draft second set of RFAs, research local rules regarding motions to compel
7/28/2017	203384	Mark A. Chavez	0.80	\$850.00	\$680.00	10-Case Org	review draft letter, review and prepare emails
7/31/2017	203243	Nance Becker	0.20	\$750.00	\$150.00	02-Discovery	Email opposing counsel regarding discovery
7/31/2017	203387	Mark A. Chavez	2.10	\$850.00	\$1,785.00	10-Case Org	research regarding claims, confer with nance regarding class certification and discovery
7/31/2017	203242	Nance Becker	3.00	\$750.00	\$2,250.00	02-Discovery	Begin drafting stipulation regarding discovery dispute
7/31/2017	203240	Nance Becker	0.40	\$750.00	\$300.00	04-Experts	Review correspondence regarding potential dietitian experts
7/31/2017	203241	Nance Becker	0.50	\$750.00	\$375.00	10-Case Org	Confer with M. Chavez regarding claims and research to be done
8/1/2017	203737	Nance Becker	0.80	\$750.00	\$600.00	04-Experts	Telephone interview of potential dietary expert
8/1/2017	203738	Nance Becker	2.80	\$750.00	\$2,100.00	02-Discovery	Telephone call with opposing counsel regarding discovery and draft confirming letter, review produced docs
8/1/2017	203390	Mark A. Chavez	2.70	\$850.00	\$2,295.00	02-Discovery	confer with nance regarding discovery class certification and discovery, research regarding claims
8/2/2017	203461	Legal Asst/Natalie Martin	1.83	\$225.00	\$412.50	02-Discovery	Review Wise documents and identifying key documents
8/2/2017	203392	Mark A. Chavez	1.40	\$850.00	\$1,190.00	02-Discovery	telephone calls with Jenna regarding website discovery, review and prepare emails regarding discovery , research regarding website
8/3/2017	203703	Nance Becker	0.30	\$750.00	\$225.00	03-Deposition	Review email from opposition counsel and prepare and forward amended deposition notice
8/3/2017	203704	Nance Becker	3.00	\$750.00	\$2,250.00	02-Discovery	Continue review of documents produced by defendant , email to co-counsel regarding same

Date	ID	Attorney	Time	Rate	Slip Value	Activity	Description
8/3/2017	203702	Nance Becker	0.80	\$750.00	\$600.00	04-Experts	Telephone interview , potential dietitian expert
8/4/2017	203462	Legal Asst/Natalie Martin	1.67	\$225.00	\$375.00	02-Discovery	Review Wise documents and identify key documents
8/4/2017	203263	Nance Becker	1.00	\$750.00	\$750.00	04-Experts	Review information regarding potential damages experts, telephone call with consultant
8/4/2017	203252	Nance Becker	0.80	\$750.00	\$600.00	04-Experts	Telephone call with D. fueroghne and review corrections from him
8/4/2017	203253	Nance Becker	0.20	\$750.00	\$150.00	10-Case Org	email dietitian expert
8/4/2017	203254	Nance Becker	1.00	\$750.00	\$750.00	02-Discovery	Confer with staff members regarding documents, review archived web pages
8/4/2017	203255	Nance Becker	0.60	\$750.00	\$450.00	03-Deposition	Begin deposition outline
8/7/2017	203676	Nance Becker	0.30	\$750.00	\$225.00	02-Discovery	Confer with assistant regarding wise websiter review
8/7/2017	203677	Nance Becker	0.60	\$750.00	\$450.00	04-Experts	Correspondence with expert N. Hudson, prepare retainer agreement
8/8/2017	203333	Nance Becker	1.00	\$750.00	\$750.00	04-Experts	Telephone call with potential damages expert and meet with M. Chavez regarding same.
8/8/2017	203336	Nance Becker	0.30	\$750.00	\$225.00	04-Experts	Emails, opposing counsel regarding discovery
8/8/2017	203337	Nance Becker	2.80	\$750.00	\$2,100.00	04-Experts	Outline person most knowledgeable deposition questions
8/8/2017	203400	Mark A. Chavez	0.80	\$850.00	\$680.00	10-Case Org	Review files and emails regarding depo
8/9/2017	203275	Legal Asst/Jenna Raden	6.00	\$225.00	\$1,350.00	02-Discovery	Convert Wise website archives to pdf using Wayback Machine; organize for deposition
8/9/2017	203280	Mark A. Chavez	2.70	\$850.00	\$2,295.00	03-Deposition	Review files; review emails; preparation for deposition
8/9/2017	203249	Nance Becker	0.50	\$750.00	\$375.00	02-Discovery	Work with staff to download documents produced by defendant.
8/10/2017	203535	Mark A. Chavez	6.40	\$850.00	\$5,440.00	10-Case Org	Prepare for deposition, review files and documents produced, review website history
8/10/2017	203345	Nance Becker	2.00	\$750.00	\$1,500.00	03-Deposition	Finish intial draft of person most knowledgeable deposition questions
8/10/2017	203346	Nance Becker	1.00	\$750.00	\$750.00	12-Research	Fact research regarding nutrition guidelines
8/10/2017	203347	Nance Becker	2.80	\$750.00	\$2,100.00	12-Research	Draft meet and confer letter to opposing counsel review documents produced by defendant, telephone call with opposing counsel regarding missing documents
8/10/2017	203274	Legal Asst/Jenna Raden	7.00	\$225.00	\$1,575.00	02-Discovery	Continue converting Wise website archives to pdf using Wayback Machine; organize for deposition
8/11/2017	203349	Nance Becker	5.00	\$750.00	\$3,750.00	02-Discovery	Continue review of wise documents confer with M. Chavez , assist with compilation of documents used at deposition and additional documents to be requested. research legal issues corrections to defendant counsel regarding documents producec by wise.

Date	ID	Attorney	Time	Rate	Slip Value	Activity	Description
8/13/2017	203637	Mark A. Chavez	3.30	\$850.00	\$2,805.00	10-Case Org	prepare for deposition, review documents produced
8/14/2017	203456	Legal Asst/Natalie Martin	2.00	\$225.00	\$450.00	02-Discovery	Continue going through Wise production docs
8/14/2017	203644	Nance Becker	0.10	\$750.00	\$75.00	04-Experts	Telephone call and email with court reporter
8/14/2017	203638	Mark A. Chavez	11.70	\$850.00	\$9,945.00	03-Deposition	travel to Salt Lake City, prepare for depo
8/14/2017	203643	Nance Becker	1.00	\$750.00	\$750.00	03-Deposition	Review documents and draft second person most knowledgeable deposition notice
8/14/2017	203645	Nance Becker	0.20	\$750.00	\$150.00	04-Experts	Telephone call with N. Hudson
8/15/2017	203454	Legal Asst/Natalie Martin	0.75	\$225.00	\$168.75	02-Discovery	Continue going through Wise discovery docs
8/15/2017	203650	Nance Becker	0.80	\$750.00	\$600.00	04-Experts	Telephone call with with potential damages expert and related emails
8/15/2017	203640	Mark A. Chavez	9.40	\$850.00	\$7,990.00	03-Deposition	Review and prepare emails, prepare for and attend deposition , travel.
8/17/2017	203453	Legal Asst/Natalie Martin	0.75	\$225.00	\$168.75	02-Discovery	Draft miller discovery for RPD3
8/28/2017	203726	Nance Becker	1.50	\$750.00	\$1,125.00	03-Deposition	Begin review of Sorenson deposition transcript
8/29/2017	203727	Nance Becker	0.20	\$750.00	\$150.00	10-Case Org	Fact research in support of claims
8/29/2017	203731	Nance Becker	0.20	\$750.00	\$150.00	05-Class cert	Confer with colleague regarding class certification issues
8/29/2017	203729	Nance Becker	1.20	\$750.00	\$900.00	03-Deposition	Finish review of Sorenson deposition and prepare short deposition summary
8/29/2017	203730	Nance Becker	0.40	\$750.00	\$300.00	05-Class cert	Forward transcript to experts, telephone call with D. Fueroghne
8/31/2017	203710	Nance Becker	0.60	\$750.00	\$450.00	04-Experts	Review and revise draft retention agreement from damage expert. telephone call with and correspondence regarding same
8/31/2017	203709	Nance Becker	0.80	\$750.00	\$600.00	02-Discovery	Review and revise protective order
9/1/2017	203713	Nance Becker	0.20	\$750.00	\$150.00	04-Experts	Correspondence with HSNO regarding retention agreement
9/1/2017	203712	Nance Becker	0.20	\$750.00	\$150.00	03-Deposition	Review defendant's discovery responses
9/12/2017	204197	Nance Becker	0.10	\$750.00	\$75.00	04-Experts	Email co-counsel regarding declarations email N. Hudson
9/12/2017	204196	Nance Becker	2.60	\$750.00	\$1,950.00	05-Class cert	Research in support of class certification motion
9/12/2017	203728	Nance Becker	1.50	\$750.00	\$1,125.00	04-Experts	Telephone interview of damages expert, forward additional case information and call references
9/25/2017	205247	Mark A. Chavez	1.90	\$850.00	\$1,615.00	04-Experts	Review and comment on drafts of expert declarations; conferences with N. Becker regarding experts; review nutrition labels produced; review correspondence regarding discovery
9/26/2017	204189	Nance Becker	2.00	\$750.00	\$1,500.00	05-Class cert	Review and edit draft client declarations

Date	ID	Attorney	Time	Rate	Slip Value	Activity	Description
9/27/2017	205244	Mark A. Chavez	1.10	\$850.00	\$935.00	10-Case Org	Review website pages; telephone call with N. Becker regarding expert declarations; review complaint
9/27/2017	204190	Nance Becker	0.20	\$750.00	\$150.00	05-Class cert	Confer with M. Chavez regarding class certification motion
9/28/2017	204238	Nance Becker	3.00	\$750.00	\$2,250.00	04-Experts	Telephone call with D. Fueroghne, make suggested edits to his declaration.
9/28/2017	204239	Nance Becker	0.80	\$750.00	\$600.00	04-Experts	Review declaration from M. Falkenhagen, make suggested edits to same
9/28/2017	204240	Nance Becker	0.20	\$750.00	\$150.00	02-Discovery	Memorandum to Mark regarding potential discovery
9/29/2017	204440	Nance Becker	5.50	\$750.00	\$4,125.00	05-Class cert	Confer with M. Chavez and revise all 3 expert declarations. Telephone call with N. Ostrofe, confer with staff regarding documents for class certification motion.
9/29/2017	205251	Mark A. Chavez	2.90	\$850.00	\$2,465.00	04-Experts	Review drafts of expert declarations; conference with N. Becker regarding experts; telephone calls with J. Raden regarding compilation of exhibits; review product pages
10/2/2017	204225	Mark A. Chavez	2.30	\$850.00	\$1,955.00	01-Pleadings	Review compilation of website pages, review and prepare emails regarding compilation, telephone call with Jenna and confer with Jenna regarding class certification.
10/2/2017	204520	Nance Becker	7.00	\$750.00	\$5,250.00	05-Class cert	Telephone calls with N. Miller and D. Fueroghne to finalize their declarations in support of class certification. Email N. Hudson regarding her revised declaration, designate excerpts from Sorensen deposition for motion exhibit. Review Falkenhagen declaration and discuss with M. Chavez, draft fact section of class certification motion.
10/3/2017	204522	Nance Becker	6.30	\$750.00	\$4,725.00	04-Experts	Further communications with experts and class representatives to finalize their declarations. Work with staff on website excerpts to be submitted in support of class certification motion.
10/4/2017	204523	Nance Becker	3.00	\$750.00	\$2,250.00	04-Experts	Correspondence with experts, draft class certification memorandum, review exhibits compiled by staff
10/5/2017	204524	Nance Becker	6.00	\$750.00	\$4,500.00	05-Class cert	Draft class certification memorandum, confer with opposition counsel
10/6/2017	204526	Nance Becker	5.60	\$750.00	\$4,200.00	05-Class cert	Work on class certification memorandum and website page cites
10/9/2017	204527	Nance Becker	7.50	\$750.00	\$5,625.00	05-Class cert	Review court filing procedures. revise brief, finalize all documents, supervise filings
10/10/2017	204771	Nance Becker	1.00	\$750.00	\$750.00	10-Case Org	Draft proposed stipulation of facts
10/10/2017	204773	Nance Becker	0.10	\$750.00	\$75.00	02-Discovery	Draft amended notice of deposition
10/10/2017	204772	Nance Becker	0.10	\$750.00	\$75.00	05-Class cert	Draft notice of errata

Date	ID	Attorney	Time	Rate	Slip Value	Activity	Description
10/12/2017	204444	Nance Becker	0.40	\$750.00	\$300.00	09-Other motion	Review court order regarding protective order and revised order proposed by defendant.
10/13/2017	204450	Nance Becker	2.00	\$750.00	\$1,500.00	10-Case Org	Review and edit defendant's changes to proposed stipulation of facts. Review and edit defendant's proposed stipulated protective order. Correspondence regarding same, and regarding deposition schedule.
10/13/2017	204448	Nance Becker	0.40	\$750.00	\$300.00	04-Experts	research regarding expert discovery correspondence with experts
10/16/2017	205235	Mark A. Chavez	0.80	\$850.00	\$680.00	10-Case Org	Review and prepare emails regarding stipulation; review proposed changes
10/17/2017	204506	Nance Becker	3.00	\$750.00	\$2,250.00	03-Deposition	Letter to defendant regarding depositions of plaintiff's and experts. Correspondence with clients regarding deposition scheduling. Draft memorandum to clients regarding deposition preparation meet with M. Chavez. begin outline for deposition preparation meeting
10/19/2017	204514	Nance Becker	0.20	\$750.00	\$150.00	05-Class cert	Prepare notice of errata regarding Falkenhagen Decl
10/19/2017	204513	Nance Becker	0.30	\$750.00	\$225.00	03-Deposition	Revise letter to opposition counsel regarding depositions.
10/26/2017	204434	Nance Becker	0.10	\$750.00	\$75.00	09-Other motion	Review order regarding defendant's proposed protective order.
10/26/2017	204433	Nance Becker	1.00	\$750.00	\$750.00	03-Deposition	Review defendant's meet and confer letter and prepare proposed schedule for plaintiff's depositions and emails defendant's regarding same.
10/26/2017	204435	Nance Becker	0.20	\$750.00	\$150.00	10-Case Org	Review and execute stipulation of facts as revised by defendant.
10/26/2017	205302	Mark A. Chavez	0.60	\$850.00	\$510.00	04-Experts	Review emails regarding depositions of experts
10/27/2017	204398	Nance Becker	2.00	\$750.00	\$1,500.00	03-Deposition	Letter to opposing counsel regarding deposition schedule and procedures. Emails to expert witnesses regarding same. Confer with co-counsel regarding expert wit. rules
10/30/2017	204537	Nance Becker	0.10	\$750.00	\$75.00	07-Settlement	Brief telephone call with with opposition counsel regarding potential mediation
10/30/2017	204536	Nance Becker	0.60	\$750.00	\$450.00	03-Deposition	Review emails from expert witnesses and email opposition counsel regarding potential deposition dates.
10/31/2017	204540	Nance Becker	0.40	\$750.00	\$300.00	07-Settlement	Meet with M. Chavez regarding defendant's proposal to meditate, email opposition counsel and co-counsel regarding same, memorandum to staff regarding compiling financial data regarding Wise.
10/31/2017	205261	Mark A. Chavez	0.80	\$850.00	\$680.00	10-Case Org	Conferences with N. Becker regarding mediation and depositions; review emails

Date	ID	Attorney	Time	Rate	Slip Value	Activity	Description
11/2/2017	204531	Nance Becker	2.50	\$750.00	\$1,875.00	07-Settlement	Telephone call with R. Shackelford regarding potential stipulation for stay and mediation. Review defendant's emailed settlement structure proposal. Telephone call with with JAMS, draft and send requested information to reserve mediation date. Draft proposed stipulation. email to clients regarding same.
11/6/2017	204418	Mark A. Chavez	1.60	\$850.00	\$1,360.00	01-Pleadings	Review defendant's proposed settlement structure, confer with nance regarding reply, review proposed stipulation, review and prepare emails regarding stipulation.
11/6/2017	204542	Nance Becker	3.50	\$750.00	\$2,625.00	07-Settlement	Meet with M. Chavez regarding defendant's initial proposed settlement structure, draft letter defendant regarding same. Review defendant's response and draft proposed order. emails with clients regarding the above.
11/7/2017	204549	Nance Becker	0.20	\$750.00	\$150.00	07-Settlement	Further correspondence with opposing counsel regarding stipulation and proposed order, finalize documents
11/8/2017	204744	Nance Becker	0.10	\$750.00	\$75.00	10-Case Org	Correspondence with opposing counsel & staff regarding stipulation.
11/9/2017	204429	Nance Becker	0.20	\$750.00	\$150.00	03-Deposition	Confer with Nance regarding status
11/13/2017	204741	Nance Becker	0.30	\$750.00	\$225.00	07-Settlement	Confe with M. Chavez regarding mediation, review correspondence from JAMS
11/14/2017	204777	Nance Becker	0.10	\$750.00	\$75.00	07-Settlement	Review and process invoice from JAMS
11/14/2017	204778	Nance Becker	0.10	\$750.00	\$75.00	10-Case Org	telephone call with court clerk
11/14/2017	204779	Nance Becker	0.30	\$750.00	\$225.00	07-Settlement	Make arrangements for mediation
11/14/2017	204776	Nance Becker	0.20	\$750.00	\$150.00	04-Experts	Respond to emails from experts
11/20/2017	204876	Nance Becker	0.10	\$750.00	\$75.00	10-Case Org	Email opposition counsel regarding status
11/28/2017	204884	Nance Becker	0.20	\$750.00	\$150.00	05-Class cert	Email opposition counsel regarding discovery and class certification.
11/30/2017	205405	Nance Becker	0.40	\$750.00	\$300.00	10-Case Org	Review court order approving stipulation; correspondence with clients and experts regarding same.
1/2/2018	205474	Nance Becker	4.50	\$750.00	\$3,375.00	07-Settlement	Respond to email from opposition counsel. Draft plaintiffs' mediation brief. Email clients regarding mediation.
1/3/2018	206041	Mark A. Chavez	2.10	\$850.00	\$1,785.00	07-Settlement	Review and edit mediation brief, confer with Nance.
1/4/2018	205475	Nance Becker	4.40	\$750.00	\$3,300.00	07-Settlement	Confer with M. Chavez and revise mediation brief. Compile exhibits and documents to takwe to mediation. Email opposing counsel regarding updated sales data.
1/4/2018	206040	Mark A. Chavez	0.90	\$850.00	\$765.00	07-Settlement	Review and edit mediation brief

Date	ID	Attorney	Time	Rate	Slip Value	Activity	Description
1/5/2018	205476	Nance Becker	1.40	\$750.00	\$1,050.00	07-Settlement	Further revisions to mediation brief. Review exemplar notice plans, email co-counsel.
1/5/2018	205467	Mark A. Chavez	1.60	\$850.00	\$1,360.00	07-Settlement	Review draft of mediation brief, confer with Nance regarding settlement position.
1/8/2018	206006	Nance Becker	0.70	\$750.00	\$525.00	07-Settlement	Revise mediation brief per comments of co-counsel, email opposing and clients
1/8/2018	205459	Mark A. Chavez	1.10	\$850.00	\$935.00	07-Settlement	Preparation of mediation brief confer with Nance regarding brief.
1/9/2018	206000	Nance Becker	0.30	\$750.00	\$225.00	07-Settlement	Memorandum to staff outlining sales data to be compiled for mediation.
1/9/2018	205462	Mark A. Chavez	0.80	\$850.00	\$680.00	07-Settlement	Review and prepare emails regarding mediation
1/11/2018	205994	Nance Becker	0.30	\$750.00	\$225.00	07-Settlement	Review defendant's mediation brief. research regarding notice plans.
1/11/2018	205996	Nance Becker	3.80	\$750.00	\$2,850.00	07-Settlement	Review and edit spreadsheets prepared by staff to use at mediation. Telephone call's with class representatives regarding mediation, review and gather documents and information for mediation.
1/11/2018	205470	Mark A. Chavez	2.10	\$850.00	\$1,785.00	07-Settlement	Review defendant's mediation brief, preparation for mediation.
1/12/2018	205471	Mark A. Chavez	1.50	\$850.00	\$1,275.00	07-Settlement	Review mediation briefs, review and prepare email regarding mediation, review file.
1/15/2018	205472	Mark A. Chavez	9.30	\$850.00	\$7,905.00	07-Settlement	Travel to LA , prepare for mediation.
1/15/2018	205926	Nance Becker	4.00	\$750.00	\$3,000.00	07-Settlement	Travel to LA for mediation.
1/16/2018	205473	Mark A. Chavez	14.40	\$850.00	\$12,240.00	07-Settlement	Prepare for and attend mediation, travel back to SF.
1/16/2018	205927	Nance Becker	13.00	\$750.00	\$9,750.00	07-Settlement	All-day mediation, travel back to S.F
1/17/2018	206046	Mark A. Chavez	0.80	\$850.00	\$680.00	07-Settlement	Review files and telephone call with M. Braun regarding settlement.
1/18/2018	205928	Nance Becker	0.40	\$750.00	\$300.00	07-Settlement	Confer with M. Chavez regarding potential settlement terms, correspond with opposing counsel regarding same, review draft status report and request for modification of scheduling order. Approve report.
1/18/2018	206675	Mark A. Chavez	1.00	\$850.00	\$850.00	10-Case Org	Confer with Nance regarding settlement, review status report and emails regarding settlement.
1/22/2018	205841	Nance Becker	0.20	\$750.00	\$150.00	07-Settlement	Review exemplars for notice program, email co-counsel.
1/23/2018	205831	Nance Becker	0.60	\$750.00	\$450.00	07-Settlement	Telephone call with with M. Braun regarding potential settlement.
1/24/2018	205710	Nance Becker	0.10	\$750.00	\$75.00	10-Case Org	Review and edit proposed order received from defendant.
1/25/2018	206673	Mark A. Chavez	0.60	\$850.00	\$510.00	10-Case Org	Telephone call with M. Braun regarding settlement, confer with Nance regarding status.
1/29/2018	205924	Mark A. Chavez	0.80	\$850.00	\$680.00	10-Case Org	Confer with Nance regarding status, review file, review email.

Date	ID	Attorney	Time	Rate	Slip Value	Activity	Description
1/29/2018	205835	Nance Becker	0.10	\$750.00	\$75.00	07-Settlement	Email to opposing counsel regarding information needed for mediation.
1/30/2018	206048	Mark A. Chavez	0.40	\$850.00	\$340.00	10-Case Org	Review emails regarding mediation.
2/1/2018	205918	Nance Becker	2.00	\$750.00	\$1,500.00	07-Settlement	Review spreadsheets and forward to staff with direction for summarizing, draft proposed claim form for class members.
2/2/2018	205899	Nance Becker	2.60	\$750.00	\$1,950.00	07-Settlement	Review new Wise website, outline proposed changes. Revise proposed claim form, review spreadsheets.
2/4/2018	205812	Mark A. Chavez	9.70	\$850.00	\$8,245.00	01-Pleadings	Travel to LA, prepare for second mediation session.
2/5/2018	205854	Nance Becker	0.10	\$750.00	\$75.00	07-Settlement	Emails regarding mediation
2/5/2018	205813	Mark A. Chavez	7.10	\$850.00	\$6,035.00	07-Settlement	Prepare for and attend mediation, travel to SF, prepare and review emails regarding settlement terms
2/7/2018	206010	Nance Becker	0.20	\$750.00	\$150.00	10-Case Org	Draft stipulation and proposed order regarding settlement and scheduling
2/7/2018	205817	Mark A. Chavez	0.60	\$850.00	\$510.00	07-Settlement	Review and prepare emails regarding settlement
2/8/2018	206014	Nance Becker	0.80	\$750.00	\$600.00	07-Settlement	Review term sheet and website changes. Review new court order and revise stipulation and proposed order. Email experts about settlement.
2/9/2018	205844	Nance Becker	0.70	\$750.00	\$525.00	07-Settlement	Begin drafting settlement agreement
2/12/2018	205847	Nance Becker	2.00	\$750.00	\$1,500.00	07-Settlement	Draft settlement agreement
2/13/2018	205849	Nance Becker	6.00	\$750.00	\$4,500.00	07-Settlement	Finish drafting settlement agreement, revise proposed claim form, draft email notice, review Court rules regarding Class Action Settlements and motions for attorney fees.
2/13/2018	206021	Mark A. Chavez	1.10	\$850.00	\$935.00	07-Settlement	Review and edit draft of settlement, confer with Nance regarding settlement.
2/14/2018	206033	Mark A. Chavez	3.20	\$850.00	\$2,720.00	07-Settlement	Review and edit settlement documents.
2/15/2018	205851	Nance Becker	3.50	\$750.00	\$2,625.00	07-Settlement	Revise settlement agreement per M. Chavez comments. Review defendant's redline. Draft notices to be sent to class and published.
2/15/2018	205880	Mark A. Chavez	3.20	\$850.00	\$2,720.00	07-Settlement	Preparation of settlement documents, confer with Nance regarding settlement, review and prepare emails regarding settlement, telephone calls with Jenna regarding data.
2/16/2018	205955	Nance Becker	4.00	\$750.00	\$3,000.00	07-Settlement	Continue drafting and editing of settlement agreement and exhibits. Meet with M. Chavez regarding same, address defendant's redlines.
2/16/2018	205885	Mark A. Chavez	1.60	\$850.00	\$1,360.00	07-Settlement	Review draft of settlement documents, research regarding notice plan, review and prepare emails regarding settlement.
2/20/2018	205891	Mark A. Chavez	1.40	\$850.00	\$1,190.00	07-Settlement	Review new data, review and prepare emails regarding settlement documents, research regarding notice plan.

Date	ID	Attorney	Time	Rate	Slip Value	Activity	Description
2/23/2018	205972	Nance Becker	0.70	\$750.00	\$525.00	07-Settlement	Begin drafting final approval order
2/26/2018	205990	Mark A. Chavez	1.30	\$850.00	\$1,105.00	01-Pleadings	Telephone call with Settlement Administrator regarding notice plan and bid, review and prepare emails regarding settlement, review data.
2/26/2018	205975	Nance Becker	4.50	\$750.00	\$3,375.00	07-Settlement	Finish drafting Proposed Final Approval Order and begin drafting Motion for Preliminary Approval. Emails with opposing counsel regarding same.
2/27/2018	205979	Nance Becker	5.20	\$750.00	\$3,900.00	07-Settlement	Draft notice and memorandum in support of Motion for Preliminary Approval.
3/1/2018	205980	Nance Becker	4.20	\$750.00	\$3,150.00	07-Settlement	Revise Motion for Preliminary Approval, begin drafting supporting declaration.
3/2/2018	205984	Nance Becker	2.00	\$750.00	\$1,500.00	07-Settlement	Finish draft declaration in support of Preliminary Approval, update supporting memorandum, email defendant's counsel, confer with M. Chavez
3/2/2018	205991	Mark A. Chavez	1.10	\$850.00	\$935.00	07-Settlement	Review and prepare emails regarding bid for settlement administrator. Telephone call with settlement administrator regarding bid, review bid.
3/5/2018	206535	Nance Becker	3.00	\$750.00	\$2,250.00	07-Settlement	Work on settlement documents, telephone call with co-counsel regarding preliminary approval draft stipulation for extension of time, confer with M. Chavez regarding motion and hearing.
3/6/2018	206541	Nance Becker	0.50	\$750.00	\$375.00	07-Settlement	Emails and telephone call with defendant's counsel, meet with M. Chavez regarding settlement.
3/12/2018	206694	Mark A. Chavez	1.60	\$850.00	\$1,360.00	10-Case Org	Review proposal for settlement administrator, telephone calls with settlement administrator, review and prepare emails regarding proposal, confer with Nance regarding status, review email.
3/12/2018	206752	Nance Becker	0.20	\$750.00	\$150.00	07-Settlement	Meet with M. Chavez regarding class notice, email opposing counsel regarding same
3/13/2018	206698	Mark A. Chavez	0.90	\$850.00	\$765.00	07-Settlement	Telephone call regarding settlement, administrative proposal, review and prepare emails.
3/14/2018	206739	Mark A. Chavez	2.90	\$850.00	\$2,465.00	10-Case Org	Review claims data, review and prepare emails regarding claims
3/15/2018	206740	Mark A. Chavez	1.30	\$850.00	\$1,105.00	07-Settlement	Telephone calls and emails regarding class notice and settlement administrator proposal.
3/19/2018	206751	Nance Becker	2.30	\$750.00	\$1,725.00	07-Settlement	Draft revised notice, discuss with M. Chavez
3/20/2018	206741	Mark A. Chavez	0.90	\$850.00	\$765.00	07-Settlement	Review changes to settlement document, review and prepare emails.
3/20/2018	206750	Nance Becker	3.20	\$750.00	\$2,400.00	07-Settlement	Update settlement agreement and all exhibits thereto and forward to opposing counsel, email settlement documents to clients.

Date	ID	Attorney	Time	Rate	Slip Value	Activity	Description
3/22/2018	206749	Nance Becker	2.20	\$750.00	\$1,650.00	07-Settlement	Update preliminary approval motion to reflect revisions to settlement documents, emails to opposing counsel.
3/22/2018	206748	Nance Becker	0.20	\$750.00	\$150.00	07-Settlement	Emails , J. Borneman and N. Miller regarding settlement.
3/23/2018	206742	Mark A. Chavez	0.70	\$850.00	\$595.00	07-Settlement	Review draft brief.
3/26/2018	206743	Mark A. Chavez	1.90	\$850.00	\$1,615.00	07-Settlement	Review and prepare emails regarding status of settlement, revise preliminary approval brief.
3/27/2018	207048	Mark A. Chavez	2.30	\$850.00	\$1,955.00	07-Settlement	Review and prepare emails regarding settlement signatures, review and edit preliminary approval papers, telephone call with Jenna regarding preparation of preliminary approval.
3/28/2018	207049	Mark A. Chavez	1.70	\$850.00	\$1,445.00	07-Settlement	Preparation of motion for preliminary approval papers, review and prepare emails regarding same.
3/29/2018	206932	Nance Becker	2.40	\$750.00	\$1,800.00	07-Settlement	Review time summary. Meet with M. Chavez, N. Miller and J. Borneman regarding their time records. Revise declaration and Memorandum of points and authorities in support of Preliminary Approval. Confer with staff regarding finalizing and filing of documents.

Supplemental
EXHIBIT 10

Braun Law Group, P.C.
Miller v. Wise Company, Inc.
[Supplemental Exhibit 10 - Detailed Time Entries]

Date	ID	Attorney	Time	Rate	Slip Value	Activity	Description
10/20/2015	17176	Michael D. Braun	0.50	\$700.00	\$350.00	10-Case Org	Conversation with Andrew Kierstead regarding case
10/21/2015	17177	Michael D. Braun	0.50	\$700.00	\$350.00	10-Case Org	Conversation with Jason Riddick regarding case
10/22/2015	17178	Michael D. Braun	4.75	\$700.00	\$3,325.00	12-Research	Research regarding case fundamentals
10/23/2015	17179	Michael D. Braun	6.00	\$700.00	\$4,200.00	12-Research	research regarding case fundamentals
11/9/2015	17180	Michael D. Braun	0.75	\$700.00	\$525.00	10-Case Org	Conversation with co-counsel regarding research; scope of case
11/9/2015	16665	Michael D. Braun	1.00	\$700.00	\$700.00	10-Case Org	Intake; Conversation with co-counsel
11/10/2015	17181	Michael D. Braun	0.50	\$700.00	\$350.00	10-Case Org	follow up with Conversation with client
11/10/2015	16666	Michael D. Braun	2.00	\$700.00	\$1,400.00	12-Research	Research for complaint; E-mail communication with client
11/12/2015	17182	Michael D. Braun	3.00	\$700.00	\$2,100.00	12-Research	research; review documents from Miller
11/17/2015	17183	Michael D. Braun	0.25	\$700.00	\$175.00	10-Case Org	Conversation with client
11/20/2015	17184	Michael D. Braun	0.50	\$700.00	\$350.00	10-Case Org	Retain Miller
11/21/2015	17188	Michael D. Braun	8.50	\$700.00	\$5,950.00	01-Pleadings	Research & Draft Complaint
11/23/2015	17189	Michael D. Braun	8.25	\$700.00	\$5,775.00	01-Pleadings	Research & Draft Complaint
11/24/2015	17187	Michael D. Braun	13.00	\$700.00	\$9,100.00	01-Pleadings	Research & Draft Complaint
11/25/2015	17190	Michael D. Braun	9.50	\$700.00	\$6,650.00	01-Pleadings	Research & Draft Complaint
11/26/2015	17191	Michael D. Braun	8.00	\$700.00	\$5,600.00	01-Pleadings	Research & Draft Complaint
11/27/2015	17192	Michael D. Braun	6.00	\$700.00	\$4,200.00	01-Pleadings	Research & Draft Complaint
11/30/2015	17185	Michael D. Braun	0.25	\$700.00	\$175.00	10-Case Org	Conversation with client
12/1/2015	17186	Michael D. Braun	0.25	\$700.00	\$175.00	10-Case Org	Conversation with client
12/7/2015	16678	Michael D. Braun	6.00	\$700.00	\$4,200.00	01-Pleadings	Complaint
12/8/2015	16676	Michael D. Braun	7.00	\$700.00	\$4,900.00	12-Research	Research
12/9/2015	16677	Michael D. Braun	3.00	\$700.00	\$2,100.00	01-Pleadings	Complaint
12/10/2015	16682	Michael D. Braun	0.50	\$700.00	\$350.00	10-Case Org	Conference call with co-counsel regarding complaint strategy.
12/29/2015	17212	Michael D. Braun	1.00	\$700.00	\$700.00	10-Case Org	Interview with Dennis Korn regarding Wise
1/5/2016	17193	Michael D. Braun	0.25	\$700.00	\$175.00	10-Case Org	Conversation with co-counsel regarding complaint
1/10/2016	17194	Michael D. Braun	4.75	\$700.00	\$3,325.00	12-Research	Research based on Korn interview revisions to complaint regarding allegations of shelf life stability
1/11/2016	16704	Michael D. Braun	3.00	\$700.00	\$2,100.00	01-Pleadings	Add additional allegations to complaint
1/11/2016	17213	Michael D. Braun	3.00	\$700.00	\$2,100.00	12-Research	Research (DOD requirements; oxygen studies
1/12/2016	17195	Michael D. Braun	1.00	\$700.00	\$700.00	10-Case Org	CLRA letter / Conversation with counsel regarding same

Date	ID	Attorney	Time	Rate	Slip Value	Activity	Description
1/12/2016	17218	Michael D. Braun	0.25	\$700.00	\$175.00	10-Case Org	Conversation with Miller
3/1/2016	17196	Michael D. Braun	0.75	\$700.00	\$525.00	10-Case Org	Conversation with Riddick regarding client for alternative product to expand class
4/4/2016	16763	Michael D. Braun	2.00	\$700.00	\$1,400.00	01-Pleadings	Further amendments to complaint
6/15/2016	16833	Michael D. Braun	2.00	\$700.00	\$1,400.00	10-Case Org	conference call with Chavez; Conversation with Stanley
7/15/2016	17197	Michael D. Braun	0.25	\$700.00	\$175.00	10-Case Org	Conversation with Riddick regarding client
8/1/2016	17198	Michael D. Braun	0.50	\$700.00	\$350.00	10-Case Org	Conversation with Borneman/ intake
8/5/2016	17199	Michael D. Braun	0.25	\$700.00	\$175.00	10-Case Org	follow up with Borneman
8/14/2016	16873	Michael D. Braun	3.00	\$700.00	\$2,100.00	01-Pleadings	Work on draft complaint; E-mail communication with client
8/14/2016	17200	Michael D. Braun	0.50	\$700.00	\$350.00	10-Case Org	collect and review docs from Borneman
11/16/2016	16902	Michael D. Braun	0.25	\$700.00	\$175.00	10-Case Org	Conversation with Mark Chavez
11/17/2016	16903	Michael D. Braun	0.25	\$700.00	\$175.00	10-Case Org	review and edit co-counsel agreement; lead plaintiff agreement
12/1/2016	16908	Michael D. Braun	0.25	\$700.00	\$175.00	10-Case Org	E-mail communication with clients regarding new retainer
12/2/2016	17201	Michael D. Braun	0.25	\$700.00	\$175.00	10-Case Org	E-mail communication with client
12/5/2016	17202	Michael D. Braun	0.25	\$700.00	\$175.00	10-Case Org	E-mail communication with client
12/23/2016	16911	Michael D. Braun	0.75	\$700.00	\$525.00	10-Case Org	E-mail communication with Borneman; E-mail communication with co-counsel regarding retention
1/9/2017	16916	Michael D. Braun	0.25	\$700.00	\$175.00	10-Case Org	E-mail communication with co-counsel
1/17/2017	16919	Michael D. Braun	0.50	\$700.00	\$350.00	10-Case Org	Conversation with Nance and Mark regarding complaint
1/30/2017	16931	Michael D. Braun	1.00	\$700.00	\$700.00	01-Pleadings	E-mail communication with co-counsel; edit complaint
2/1/2017	16932	Michael D. Braun	0.50	\$700.00	\$350.00	01-Pleadings	Review and edit draft complaint
2/6/2017	16936	Michael D. Braun	0.25	\$700.00	\$175.00	10-Case Org	E-mail communication with clients
2/7/2017	16935	Michael D. Braun	0.10	\$700.00	\$70.00	10-Case Org	E-mail communication with co-counsel
2/21/2017	16944	Michael D. Braun	0.25	\$700.00	\$175.00	10-Case Org	E-mail communication with client
3/3/2017	16946	Michael D. Braun	0.25	\$700.00	\$175.00	10-Case Org	review cmc order; E-mail communication with co-counsel
4/4/2017	16974	Michael D. Braun	0.75	\$700.00	\$525.00	10-Case Org	Conversation with co-counsel regarding status of case, scheduling issues. reviewed answer
4/4/2017	16973	Michael D. Braun	0.25	\$700.00	\$175.00	10-Case Org	review court order; respond to co-counsel
4/6/2017	16976	Michael D. Braun	1.00	\$700.00	\$700.00	02-Discovery	Review RFP; E-mail communication with co-counsel regarding class cert issues and discovery
4/7/2017	17203	Michael D. Braun	0.25	\$700.00	\$175.00	10-Case Org	E-mail communication with co-counsel
4/18/2017	16999	Michael D. Braun	0.35	\$700.00	\$245.00	02-Discovery	Review RFA

Date	ID	Attorney	Time	Rate	Slip Value	Activity	Description
4/18/2017	16999	Michael D. Braun	0.40	\$700.00	\$280.00	10-Case Org	E-mail communication with co-counsel regarding RFA; E-mail Jason Riddick the final retainers
4/19/2017	17002	Michael D. Braun	0.25	\$700.00	\$175.00	10-Case Org	E-mail communication with co-counsel regarding Borneman signature; E-mail communication with client regarding same
4/21/2017	17004	Michael D. Braun	1.00	\$700.00	\$700.00	02-Discovery	Draft 3P discovery; E-mail communication with co-counsel regarding same.
4/21/2017	17003	Michael D. Braun	0.25	\$700.00	\$175.00	02-Discovery	Review and edit 26(f) Report
4/27/2017	17012	Michael D. Braun	0.75	\$700.00	\$525.00	02-Discovery	serve 3P subpoenas
4/27/2017	17008	Michael D. Braun	1.00	\$700.00	\$700.00	02-Discovery	26(f) conference; pre and post conversation with Nance Becker
5/2/2017	17205	Michael D. Braun	0.25	\$700.00	\$175.00	02-Discovery	E-mail communication with Walmart regarding subpoena
5/2/2017	17204	Michael D. Braun	0.50	\$700.00	\$350.00	02-Discovery	edits to 26(f)
5/4/2017	17206	Michael D. Braun	0.50	\$700.00	\$350.00	02-Discovery	review Costco settlement from co-counsel
5/10/2017	17214	Michael D. Braun	0.25	\$700.00	\$175.00	02-Discovery	review correspondence from Walmart regarding 3P subpoena
5/17/2017	17215	Michael D. Braun	1.00	\$700.00	\$700.00	02-Discovery	review 3P objections from Home Depot and Amazon; Conversation with HD counsel
5/22/2017	17022	Michael D. Braun	0.50	\$700.00	\$350.00	02-Discovery	Draft initial disclosures
5/23/2017	17023	Michael D. Braun	0.50	\$700.00	\$350.00	02-Discovery	Review and edit Rule 26 initial disclosures;E-mail communication with co-counsel regarding
5/26/2017	17027	Michael D. Braun	0.50	\$700.00	\$350.00	02-Discovery	meet & confer with Walmart; E-mail communication with to co-counsel regarding same
6/15/2017	17208	Michael D. Braun	0.25	\$700.00	\$175.00	02-Discovery	Review draft motion to compel letter
6/15/2017	17037	Michael D. Braun	1.00	\$700.00	\$700.00	02-Discovery	Review defendants discovery responses
6/19/2017	17041	Michael D. Braun	0.75	\$700.00	\$525.00	02-Discovery	Conversation with co-counsel regarding discovery
6/28/2017	17209	Michael D. Braun	0.25	\$700.00	\$175.00	04-Experts	E-mail communication with co-counsel regarding experts
7/24/2017	17063	Michael D. Braun	0.25	\$700.00	\$175.00	10-Case Org	E-mail communication with client
7/25/2017	17062	Michael D. Braun	0.25	\$700.00	\$175.00	10-Case Org	E-mail communication with client; co-counsel
7/28/2017	17211	Michael D. Braun	0.25	\$700.00	\$175.00	10-Case Org	E-mail communication with co-counsel
8/8/2017	17067	Michael D. Braun	0.25	\$700.00	\$175.00	02-Discovery	review email from co-counsel regarding potential witness; review E-mail communication from co-counsel regarding depositions; and defendant production
8/29/2017	17210	Michael D. Braun	0.50	\$700.00	\$350.00	02-Discovery	review Sorenson trx
9/10/2017	17103	Michael D. Braun	1.00	\$700.00	\$700.00	02-Discovery	Review Wise discovery responses; review trx
9/21/2017	17107	Michael D. Braun	1.00	\$700.00	\$700.00	07-Settlement	Conversation with Nicholas Miller; draft plaintiff declaration

Date	ID	Attorney	Time	Rate	Slip Value	Activity	Description
9/22/2017	17111	Michael D. Braun	2.00	\$700.00	\$1,400.00	07-Settlement	conversations with clients about decls; draft declarations
9/26/2017	17113	Michael D. Braun	1.00	\$700.00	\$700.00	07-Settlement	Plaintiff Declarations
10/30/2017	17207	Michael D. Braun	0.25	\$700.00	\$175.00	10-Case Org	E-mail communication with co-counsel
11/6/2017	17146	Michael D. Braun	0.25	\$700.00	\$175.00	07-Settlement	review settlement proposal; E-mail communication with co-counsel
1/7/2018	17167	Michael D. Braun	0.50	\$700.00	\$350.00	07-Settlement	Review and comment on mediation brief
1/11/2018	17217	Michael D. Braun	0.25	\$700.00	\$175.00	07-Settlement	Review Wise mediation brief
1/12/2018	17216	Michael D. Braun	0.25	\$700.00	\$175.00	10-Case Org	Conversation with Riddick regarding status of case
1/17/2018	17222	Michael D. Braun	0.50	\$700.00	\$350.00	07-Settlement	Conversation with M Chvez regarding mediation
1/23/2018	17228	Michael D. Braun	1.00	\$700.00	\$700.00	07- Settlement	Conversation with Riddick regarding mediation and client contact
1/23/2018	17232	Michael D. Braun	0.50	\$700.00	\$350.00	07-Settlement	Conversation with Nance Becker regarding mediation; E-mail communications with clients regarding same
1/24/2018	17233	Michael D. Braun	0.50	\$700.00	\$350.00	10-Case Org	Conversation with Nick Miller regarding status of Case Organization
1/24/2018	17234	Michael D. Braun	0.50	\$700.00	\$350.00	10-Case Org	Conversation with Jeff Borneman
2/7/2018	17238	Michael D. Braun	0.25	\$700.00	\$175.00	10-Case Org	Review term sheet: E-mail communication with clients; E-mail communication with co-counsel
2/8/2018	17239	Michael D. Braun	0.50	\$700.00	\$350.00	07- Settlement	Conversation with each client regarding terms of the settlement; E-mail communication with co-counsel regarding same
2/13/2018	17244	Michael D. Braun	0.10	\$700.00	\$70.00	10-Case Org	E-mail communication with co-counsel
3/7/2018	17248	Michael D. Braun	0.25	\$700.00	\$175.00	07-Settlement	Review settlement papers; court standing order regarding preliminary settlement; E-mail communication with co-counsel regarding same
3/21/2018	17254	Michael D. Braun	0.75	\$700.00	\$525.00	07-Settlement	Review settlement agreement; notes to co-counsel
3/27/2018	17256	Michael D. Braun	0.25	\$700.00	\$175.00	07-Settlement	E-mail communication with Co-counsel regarding preliminary approval motion; Telephone conference with co-counsel (Andrew Kierstead/PW) regarding same
3/28/2018	17259	Michael D. Braun	0.25	\$700.00	\$175.00	07-Settlement	Telephone conference with co-counsel regarding prelim approval brief
3/29/2018	17260	Michael D. Braun	0.25	\$700.00	\$175.00	07- Settlement	Conversation with co-counsel regarding prelim approval motion
3/30/2018	17261	Michael D. Braun	0.50	\$700.00	\$350.00	07-Settlement	Conversation with counsel regarding prelim app filing (Riddick, PNW)